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A mother’s worst nightmare: the subway doors close with her baby son still on the train. In this suspenseful
debut novel, a woman goes to unimaginable lengths to get her child back.

A struggling, single mother, Emma sometimes wishes that her thirteen-month-old son Ritchie would just
disappear. Then, one quiet Sunday evening, after a sinister encounter on the London Underground—Ritchie
does just that.

Emma immediately reports his abduction to the police but there she faces a much worse situation than she
ever imagined. Why do the police seem so reluctant to help her? And why do they think she would want hurt
her own child?

If Emma wants Ritchie back, she’ll have to find him herself. With the help of a stranger named Rafe, the one
person who seems to believe her, Emma sets off in search of her son. She is determined to find Ritchie no
matter what it takes…but who exactly is the real enemy here?

With dark twists and intertwining narratives, The Stranger on the Train is an unforgettable novel of
psychological suspense that you will keep you guessing until the shattering finale.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Amos:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of numerous ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how
the character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you
read this The Stranger on the Train: A Novel, you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about
yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a reserve.

Elsie Port:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, limited story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping The Stranger on the Train: A
Novel that give your fun preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading routine all over the world
can be said as the opportunity for people to know world a great deal better then how they react toward the
world. It can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the geeky individual but for all of you who
wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit, you could pick The
Stranger on the Train: A Novel become your own personal starter.

Joseph Lunsford:

Beside this particular The Stranger on the Train: A Novel in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to
get closer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is
fresh from the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow small town. It is
good thing to have The Stranger on the Train: A Novel because this book offers to your account readable
information. Do you occasionally have book but you don't get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that
would not happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss it? Find this book along with read it from at this
point!

Wanda Holmes:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And
you know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something
by book. Many kinds of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is The Stranger on the Train:
A Novel.
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