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Traces the connection between slavery and the way in which black women fiction writers depict female
characters and address gender issues, particularly maternity.

Using writers such as Harriet Wilson, Frances E. W. Harper, Pauline Hopkins, Toni Morrison, Sherley Anne
Williams, and Gayl Jones, the author highlights recurring themes and the various responses of black women
writers to the issues of race and gender. Time and again these writers link slavery with motherhood--their
depictions of black womanhood are tied to the effects of slavery and represented through the black mother.
Patton shows that both the image others have of black women as well as black women's own self image is
framed and influenced by the history of slavery. This history would have us believe that female slaves were
mere breeders and not mothers. However, Patton uses the mother figure as a tool to create an intriguing
interdisciplinary literary analysis.

"Women in Chains establishes the liberational context of black women's fiction through close and careful
readings of archetypal text and through the application of sophisticated literary analysis grounded in the
living legacy of our own 'talking books.' In this book, Patton walks a weary mile in the shoes of her chosen
foremothers and finds her own place  in the tradition." -- Joanne M. Braxton, The College of William and
Mary
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From reader reviews:

Marilyn Daniels:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind
of publication you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel
happy read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Women in Chains: The
Legacy of Slavery in Black Women's Fiction (SUNY series in African American Studies) is kind of e-book
which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Mary McClellan:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find reserve that need more time to be
examine. Women in Chains: The Legacy of Slavery in Black Women's Fiction (SUNY series in African
American Studies) can be your answer since it can be read by a person who have those short spare time
problems.

Susan Woods:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many concern for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but additionally novel and Women in Chains: The Legacy of
Slavery in Black Women's Fiction (SUNY series in African American Studies) or even others sources were
given understanding for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel want to read more and more.
Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to
bring their knowledge. In some other case, beside science book, any other book likes Women in Chains: The
Legacy of Slavery in Black Women's Fiction (SUNY series in African American Studies) to make your spare
time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this one.

Gloria Lafreniere:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library as well as
to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or real their
pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As
we know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this Women in Chains: The Legacy of Slavery in Black Women's Fiction



(SUNY series in African American Studies) can make you sense more interested to read.
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