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How did the biological, brain and behavioural structures underlying human language evolve? When, why
and where did our ancestors become linguistic animals, and what has happened since? This book provides a
clear, comprehensive but lively introduction to these interdisciplinary debates. Written in an approachable
style, it cuts through the complex, sometimes contradictory and often obscure technical languages used in the
different scientific disciplines involved in the study of linguistic evolution. Assuming no background
knowledge in these disciplines, the book outlines the physical and neurological structures underlying
language systems, and the limits of our knowledge concerning their evolution. Discussion questions and
further reading lists encourage students to explore the primary literature further, and the final chapter
demonstrates that while many questions still remain unanswered, there is a growing consensus as to how
modern human languages have arisen as systems by the interplay of evolved structures and cultural
transmission.
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From reader reviews:

Carole Clark:

Evolutionary Linguistics (Cambridge Textbooks in Linguistics) can be one of your nice books that are good
idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary which could
increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to place every word into pleasure arrangement in writing
Evolutionary Linguistics (Cambridge Textbooks in Linguistics) nevertheless doesn't forget the main stage,
giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource information that maybe you can be certainly
one of it. This great information could drawn you into fresh stage of crucial considering.

James Roberts:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer might be Evolutionary Linguistics (Cambridge Textbooks in Linguistics) why
because the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The
inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to
pick up this book.

Fran Short:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside using friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Evolutionary Linguistics
(Cambridge Textbooks in Linguistics) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.

Ricardo Donaldson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you
know that little person such as reading or as reading become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by book. Many
kinds of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is Evolutionary Linguistics
(Cambridge Textbooks in Linguistics).
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