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The sequel to the #1 Kindle bestseller Bad Games. Now optioned as a feature film!
____________________________________________________

In Bad Games, the Lamberts weren't safe at the family cabin.
Now they aren't safe anywhere.

Playtime is not over...

In Autumn of 2008, the Lambert family headed to western Pennsylvania for a weekend getaway to the
family cabin.

They visited hell instead:

The Fannelli brothers. Two psychopaths who believed themselves exceptional, put on this Earth for the soul
purpose of tormenting others for their own amusement. To make people play their twisted games.

Except the Lamberts managed the impossible. They played the game and survived. Showed the Fannelli
brothers that they'd messed with the wrong family.

However, the game is far from over. There are some new players in town. Players who appear to have close
ties to the Fannelli brothers. Players who are taking things very personally...and promising results that are
very deadly.

If you thought you'd glimpsed evil before, prepare to plummet headfirst into the abyss as award-winning
author Jeff Menapace shows you a new level of fear and heart-stopping suspense.

Let the vengeful games begin...
____________________________________________________

Praise for Jeff Menapace and his award-winning fiction:

-Winner of the 2011 Red Adept Reviews Indie Award for Horror 

"I find the author to be ridiculously talented." -MichelleR, Red Adept Reviews

"If you're a Richard Laymon fan, check out Bad Games...a gritty and very dark read that's rough around the
edges in a refreshing way." - Bill Braddock, author of BREW

"If you like Jonathan Kellerman, you'll love Bad Games. Read on if you dare!"
-indiereader.com



"Jeff Menapace is one of the rising stars of the horror thriller genre...he can scare the daylights out of the best
of them." - J. Chambers, Amazon Hall of Fame, Top 10 Reviewer

"This psychological thriller will keep you totally captivated and enthralled." -Top Ten Psychological
Thrillers

______________________________________________________

The Bad Games trilogy can be downloaded for FREE as part of your Kindle Unlimited subscription. Enjoy
these e-books on your Amazon Kindle Fire, your smartphone, or even your laptop after downloading the
FREE Amazon Books Kindle app.

* * *

The Bad Games trilogy is featured in several Kindle Unlimited categories such as: horror, suspense thrillers,
crime thriller, psychological thriller, psychological thriller books, thriller books, new thrillers, serial killer
fiction, new horror, kidnapping fiction, kindle unlimited novels, murder, suspense books, best sellers fiction,
crime fiction novels, best horror novel, suspense thrillers in kindle books, horror novels, kindle horror
novels, new books, books series, and kindle unlimited books. 
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From reader reviews:

David Unruh:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book.
They can be reading whatever they have because their hobby is definitely reading a book. How about the
person who don't like examining a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found
difficult problem as well as exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Vengeful Games - A Dark
Psychological Thriller (Bad Games Series Book 2).

Scott Croft:

This book untitled Vengeful Games - A Dark Psychological Thriller (Bad Games Series Book 2) to be one of
several books which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of
benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retailer or you can order it via online.
The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read
this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this publication from your list.

Joy Rodriguez:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their story
or perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children,
there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their expertise
in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of them is this Vengeful
Games - A Dark Psychological Thriller (Bad Games Series Book 2).

Sam Dickson:

You will get this Vengeful Games - A Dark Psychological Thriller (Bad Games Series Book 2) by visit the
bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for ones
knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only through written or printed but additionally can you
enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by your local mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your
e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose
right ways for you.
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