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Western medicine—especially in contrast with non-Western traditions of medical practice—is widely
thought of as a coherent and unified field in which beliefs, definitions, and judgments are shared. Marc Berg
and Annemarie Mol debunk this myth with an interdisciplinary and intercultural collection of essays that
reveals the significantly varied ways practitioners of “conventional” Western medicine handle bodies, study
test results, configure statistics, and converse with patients .
Combining theoretical work with interviews and direct observation of the activities and interactions of
doctors, nurses, technicians, and patients, the contributors to this volume provide comparative studies of
specific cases. Individual chapters explore topics such as the contested domain of fetal surgery in a
California hospital, the construction of gender identity before transsexual surgery in Germany, and
differences in the treatment and definition of pain by two clinics in France. Differences in Medicine advances
earlier studies on medicine’s social diversity and regional variations to expose significant differences in the
presumptions and decisions that affect patients’ lives, and marks a dramatic development in both the study of
medicine and in science studies generally.
Revealing the ways in which the bodies and lives of people are constructed as medical objects by
practitioners, technologies, and textbooks, this collection calls for and initiates new, more textured
investigations and theories of the body in medicine and the practice of science. It will open new discussions
among medical and healthcare professionals as well as scholars in medical anthropology, science studies,
sociology, philosophy, and the history of medicine.

Contributors. Isabelle Baszanger, Marc Berg, Geoffrey C. Bowker, Monica J. Casper, Charis M. Cussins,
Nicolas Dodier, Stefan Hirschauer, Annemarie Mol, Vicky Singleton, Susan Leigh Star, Stefan
Timmermans, Dick Willems
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From reader reviews:

Diane Adams:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or maybe goal; it means that reserve
has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is actually reading a book. Think about the person
who don't like reading through a book? Sometime, individual feel need book if they found difficult problem
or perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will need this Differences in Medicine: Unraveling Practices,
Techniques, and Bodies (Body, Commodity, Text).

Lula Barnes:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time
to take a go walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book called
Differences in Medicine: Unraveling Practices, Techniques, and Bodies (Body, Commodity, Text)? Maybe it
is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can
better than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have various other opinion?

Hilda Dolan:

Often the book Differences in Medicine: Unraveling Practices, Techniques, and Bodies (Body, Commodity,
Text) will bring someone to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to explain the idea
is very unique. When you try to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book Differences
in Medicine: Unraveling Practices, Techniques, and Bodies (Body, Commodity, Text) is much recommended
to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can quicker to read the
book.

Christopher Melendez:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their reader with their story or perhaps
their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write about the ability about
something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are
many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always try to improve their skill in writing,
they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this Differences in
Medicine: Unraveling Practices, Techniques, and Bodies (Body, Commodity, Text).
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