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The British explorer Sir Richard F. Burton (1821-90) was a colourful and often controversial character. A
talented linguist and keen ethnologist, he worked in India during the 1840s as an interpreter and intelligence
officer for General Sir Charles Napier, and published several books about his experiences in 1851-2. He first
gained celebrity, however, for his adventurous 1853 trip to Mecca, under the disguise of a pilgrim, which is
described in this lively three-volume publication (1855-6). Few Europeans had ever visited the Muslim holy
places; one of them was John Lewis Burckhardt, whose 1829 account is also reissued in this series. Volume
1 of Burton's book describes his arrival in Egypt, the weeks he spent in Alexandria and Cairo polishing his
linguistic and cultural skills, and how, at the end of Ramadan, he travelled to Suez by camel, and from there
by boat to Yanbu al-Bahr.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Smith:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the title Personal Narrative of a
Pilgrimage to El-Medinah and Meccah (Cambridge Library Collection - Travel, Middle East and Asia
Minor) (Volume 1) suitable to you? Often the book was written by well-known writer in this era. Typically
the book untitled Personal Narrative of a Pilgrimage to El-Medinah and Meccah (Cambridge Library
Collection - Travel, Middle East and Asia Minor) (Volume 1)is a single of several books that everyone read
now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter
the new way of measuring that you ever know previous to. The author explained their strategy in the simple
way, and so all of people can easily to know the core of this guide. This book will give you a lot of
information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the world with this book.

Donald Hamann:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or
all their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book might be option to fill your totally free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the guide untitled Personal Narrative of a Pilgrimage to El-Medinah and Meccah (Cambridge
Library Collection - Travel, Middle East and Asia Minor) (Volume 1) can be fine book to read. May be it
may be best activity to you.

Thomas Woods:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Personal Narrative of a Pilgrimage to
El-Medinah and Meccah (Cambridge Library Collection - Travel, Middle East and Asia Minor) (Volume 1),
you are able to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang-out
type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called reading
friends.

Bonnie Wilson:

Personal Narrative of a Pilgrimage to El-Medinah and Meccah (Cambridge Library Collection - Travel,
Middle East and Asia Minor) (Volume 1) can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in



words, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article author giving
his/her effort to get every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Personal Narrative of a Pilgrimage to
El-Medinah and Meccah (Cambridge Library Collection - Travel, Middle East and Asia Minor) (Volume 1)
nevertheless doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource
information that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can certainly drawn you into new
stage of crucial thinking.
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