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"Most of the contributions strongly project the authors' perceptions of the role of race on their subjects, and
essays should elicit lively discussions in the classroom."
—CHOICE

Frederick Douglass liked to say of West Indian boxer Peter Jackson that "Peter is doing a great deal with his
fists to solve the Negro question." His comment reflects the possibilities for social transformation that he saw
in the emerging modern sports culture. Indeed, as the twentieth century developed, sports have become an
important cultural terrain over which various racial groups have contested, defined, and represented their
racial, national, and inter-ethnic identities.

Sports Matters brings critical attention to the centrality of race within the politics and pleasures of the
massive sports culture that developed in the U.S. during the past century and a half. The contributors
collected here address such issues as popular representations of blacks in sports. They consider
baseball—from Nisei players in Oregon to Mexican-Americans in Los Angeles. And they look at the use of
warrior imagery in representations of Native American athletes and the evolution of black expressive style
within basketball.

Sports Matters challenges our presumptions about sports, illuminating in the process the complexities of
race and gender as they relate to popular culture.

Contributors include Amy Bass, John Bloom, Annie Gilbert Coleman, Gena Caponi, Montye Fuse, Randy
Hanson, Michiko Hase, George Lipsitz, Keith Miller, Sharon O'Brien, Connie Razza, Sam Regalado, Greg
Rodriguez, Julio Rodriguez, Michael Willard, and Henry Yu.
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From reader reviews:

Kathryn Hill:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Sports Matters: Race, Recreation,
and Culture guide written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that may be understand
by anyone who all read the book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and publishing
skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still uncertainty Sports Matters: Race, Recreation, and
Culture as good book but not only by the cover but also from the content. This is one e-book that can break
don't judge book by its include, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your
looking at sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Amanda Stone:

The book untitled Sports Matters: Race, Recreation, and Culture contain a lot of information on this. The
writer explains the girl idea with easy approach. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do
certainly not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was published by famous author. The author
provides you in the new age of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want
to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice learn.

Sam Nielsen:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will
make anyone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for you is Sports Matters: Race, Recreation, and Culture this publication consist a lot of the
information on the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has
grown up. The words styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some
study when he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.

Pauline Browne:

You will get this Sports Matters: Race, Recreation, and Culture by check out the bookstore or Mall. Only
viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of
this publication are various. Not only by written or printed and also can you enjoy this book through e-book.
In the modern era just like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem.
Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your publication. It is most
important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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