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"The Athenians." This was the term Thucydides used most often when referring to the sovereign at Athens.
For the collective citizenry--the demos--ruled in this ancient state. Two and a half millennia later, in the
United States and other liberal-representative countries, we cannot say the same. We Americans--the 99%--
clearly do not rule in our own country. The notion that we live in a democracy is a patent absurdity. It is the
1% and their minions who are the masters of the game being played. The political system currently
prevailing in the Western world is the product of the great European revolutions of the 17th and 18th
centuries. The first of these, the English Revolution, effectively toppled the monarchy and raised the
parliamentary class to power. The so-called American Revolution merely instituted, on this side of the
Atlantic, a new-fangled variant of the oligarchical British Constitution. The radical reformers of the
Progressive Era were the first Americans to see the necessity of overturning the elitist form of government
established in 1787. Today that necessity is again being widely and deeply felt. In The Racket and the
Answer, historian and political activist Ted Aranda examines the all-important concepts/phenomena of
democracy and revolution in historical perspective, thereby helping us to see as clearly as possible what we
now need to do.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Gagne:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book The Racket and the Answer: The Representative System
and the Democratic Alternative. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we
know about how is important a book The Racket and the Answer: The Representative System and the
Democratic Alternative. You can add information and of course you can around the world with a book.
Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize everything! From your country until foreign or
abroad you will end up known. About simple point until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we
can open a book or even searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel
weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Donald Andrews:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or data even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you is you
don't know what one you should start with. This The Racket and the Answer: The Representative System and
the Democratic Alternative is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book
serves what you want and want in this era.

Sharon Garcia:

This book untitled The Racket and the Answer: The Representative System and the Democratic Alternative
to be one of several books which best seller in this year, this is because when you read this guide you can get
a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retailer or you can order it by using
online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since
you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Patrick Bergeron:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, as well as soon. The The Racket and the Answer: The Representative System and the Democratic
Alternative offer you a new experience in examining a book.
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